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Race and Place

Since the Immigration Act of 1965, there has been 
substantial growth in the presence of nonwhite 
immigrants to the United States. Although the for-
eign-born population in the United States stood at 
slightly less than 10 million in 1970, it currently 
stands at roughly 40 million, nearly 13 percent of 
the total U.S. population (Grieco and Trevelyan 
2010). These immigration patterns have contrib-
uted to dramatic changes in the demographic com-
position of the United States. For example, Latin 
American immigrants alone, who currently consti-
tute more than half of the nation’s foreign-born 
population, will be the source of over 60 percent of 
the nation’s population growth over the next 40 

years and are projected to constitute nearly one-
third of the total U.S. population by 2050 (U.S. 
Census Bureau 2008).

Similarly, since Congress’s repeal of the 
Chinese Exclusion Act in 1943 and the relaxation 
of immigration laws under the McCarran Act of 
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groups as a result of being phenotypically different from white Americans. Specifically, the authors examine 
the link between skin shade, perhaps the most noticeable phenotypical characteristic, and wages for 
immigrants from five regions: (1) Europe and Central Asia; (2) China, East Asia, South Asia, and the Pacific; 
(3) Latin America and the Caribbean; (4) Sub-Saharan Africa; and (5) the Middle East and North Africa. Using 
data from the New Immigrant Survey, a  nationally representative multi-cohort longitudinal study of new 
legal immigrants to the United States, the authors find a skin shade penalty in wages for darker immigrants. 
However, disaggregating by region of origin shows that this finding is driven exclusively by the experience 
of immigrants from Latin America; the wage penalty for skin tone is substantial for self-reported nonblack 
Latin American immigrants. The effects of colorism are much less pronounced or nonexistent among other 
national-origin populations. Furthermore, although a skin shade penalty is not discernible among African 
immigrants, findings show that African immigrants experience a racial wage penalty.

Keywords
skin shade, discrimination, earnings, immigrants, United States

http://crossmark.crossref.org/dialog/?doi=10.1177%2F2332649215600718&domain=pdf&date_stamp=2015-09-04


88	 Sociology of Race and Ethnicity 2(1) 

1952, there has been a dramatic increase in immi-
gration from Asian countries. The population of 
Asian origin within the United States has tripled 
over the past three decades (Xie and Goyette 2004). 
Immigrants from Caribbean countries accounted 
for 10 percent of the foreign-born population in 
2000 (Gelatt and Dixon 2006), and African immi-
grants constitute 3 percent of the foreign-born pop-
ulation, corresponding to over 1 million people 
(Grieco 2004). It is estimated that almost one in 
four youths aged 18 years and younger in the 
United States is foreign born or has foreign-born 
parents, and this proportion continues to grow 
(Portes and Rumbaut 2014).

The rise in the foreign-born population has 
occurred simultaneously with shifts in the structure 
of the U.S. labor force since the mid-1970s (Danziger 
and Gottschalk 1995; Morris and Western 1999). In 
this context, the economic and educational position 
of immigrant groups within the United States is var-
ied and drastically unequal. On average, Asian 
immigrants have achieved comparatively high 
degrees of economic success in the United States, 
but many immigrants from Latin America, the 
Caribbean, and Africa have been incorporated into 
lower status occupations. Specifically, 51 percent of 
foreign-born Asians aged 25 years and older hold 
bachelor’s degrees or higher, compared with only 12 
percent, 38 percent, and 20 percent of their counter-
parts born in Latin America, Africa, and the 
Caribbean, respectively (Kent 2007; U.S. Census 
Bureau 2006). Similarly, the median household 
income of Asians is over $68,000, which is nearly 
$30,000 more than the median income of immi-
grants from Latin America, Africa, and the 
Caribbean. Only one tenth of foreign-born Asians 
live below the poverty line, compared with one fifth 
of the population for the other aforementioned 
groups (Kent 2007; U.S. Census Bureau 2006).

The magnitude of socioeconomic differences 
between immigrant groups and the substantial 
increases in their respective populations make it 
essential for researchers and policy makers to 
understand the pathways taken by groups entering 
the United States from different regions of the 
world. Previous studies have shown that assimila-
tion and integration patterns can be conditional on 
a range of structural factors that result in segmented 
patterns of immigrant incorporation (Portes and 
Zhou 1993; Zhou 1997). Given the history of dif-
ferential treatment of ethnic minorities within the 
United States, one factor that warrants greater 
attention is discrimination. Although the 
Immigration Act of 1965 dismantled the restrictive 

barriers of earlier immigration laws and reduced 
preference for individuals from European coun-
tries, members of nonwhite immigrant groups still 
may experience discriminatory penalties in U.S 
labor markets.

The purpose of this study is to determine 
whether a labor market penalty extends to some 
members of immigrant groups as a result of being 
phenotypically different from the white American 
norm, the racial majority in the United States. 
Specifically, we examine the link between skin 
shade, perhaps the most noticeable phenotypical 
characteristic, and wages for immigrants from five 
regions: (1) Europe and Central Asia; (2) China, 
East Asia, South Asia, and the Pacific; (3) Latin 
America and the Caribbean; (4) Sub-Saharan 
Africa; and (5) the Middle East and North Africa. 
Previous research has established a wage penalty 
associated with darker skin tones among immigrant 
workers in the United States. For example, using 
data from the New Immigrant Survey (NIS), the 
only nationally representative data set on new 
immigrants to the United States that also contains 
measures of skin shade, Hersch (2008) found that a 
lighter skin tone can result in approximately 17 
percent more in earnings for immigrants, even after 
controlling for educational attainment and other 
productivity-linked demographic characteristics.

However, Hersch (2008) and most previous 
studies using the NIS grouped immigrants from all 
countries and racial groups into a single sample or 
focused exclusively on immigrants from particular 
regions (e.g., Frank, Redstone Akresh, and Lu 
2010), making it unclear whether the skin shade 
effect identified in previous studies is invariant 
across all racial and national-origin groups. We 
address this issue in this study by conducting an 
analysis of the link between skin tone and wages for 
immigrants disaggregated by region and by race.

In the remainder of this article, we explain why 
it is reasonable, given previous research, to expect 
that immigrants with darker skin tone will experi-
ence a wage penalty relative to those with lighter 
skin tone, followed by a description of our analytic 
plan and results. We conclude by discussing the 
implications of our findings for understanding the 
differential patterns of assimilation and integration 
for immigrants from different regions of the world.

Labor Market Penalties and Minorities 
within the United States
The black experience in the United States is deeply 
rooted in socioeconomic disadvantage stemming 
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from government sanctioned discriminatory treat-
ment, dating back to the era of slavery (before 1865) 
through the era of Jim Crow (1876–1965). 
Historically, much of the discrimination in the 
United States has been directed against black 
Americans as the primary targets of stigmatization. 
Thus, to the extent that immigrants experience dis-
crimination, one might anticipate that their exposure 
to discrimination also will fall along racial lines.

Most previous studies on discriminatory labor 
market penalties have examined the labor market 
experiences of black Americans. In general, 
research shows that blacks experience differential 
treatment relative to their white counterparts 
(Darity, Jason, and Guilkey 2001). For example, 
although both whites and blacks older than 25 
experience increased earnings with each additional 
level of schooling, whites earn more than blacks at 
each level of schooling. Moreover, research sug-
gests that blacks with some college or associate’s 
degrees have higher unemployment rates than 
whites who never finished high school (Harris 
2011).

Studies based on the National Longitudinal 
Survey of Youth have shown that although no 
black-white wage gap exists at labor force entry, a 
racial wage gap develops over time as blacks reap 
relatively smaller gains from job mobility (Oettinger 
1996; Tomaskovic-Devey, Thomas, and Johnson 
2005). The black wage disadvantage persists net of 
education, experience, hours worked, occupation, 
authority, region, and city size (Smith 1997). 
Furthermore, the Council on Contemporary 
Families has shown that although this income gap 
declined over the last quarter of the twentieth cen-
tury, blacks in supervisory positions earned roughly 
80 percent of the income earned by whites near the 
end of the century (McBride Murry and Liu 2014).

Many of these patterns transcend gender. 
Despite the gains made by black women between 
1940 and 1980, they continue to earn less than their 
white counterparts (Anderson and Shapiro 1996). 
Furthermore, Anderson and Shapiro (1996) showed 
that black women are less likely to hold high-wage 
occupations than their white counterparts, even if 
they have parallel levels of education, work experi-
ence, job tenure, and type of occupation. In fact, 
they must have higher levels of education, work 
experience, and job tenure relative to their white 
female counterparts to obtain high-wage occupa-
tions. Hamilton, Austin, and Darity (2011) pro-
duced similar findings.

The black labor market penalty is robust. It also 
exists for nonwage labor market outcomes, 

including promotions, processes that determine 
promotions, and layoffs. For example, using data 
from the National Organizational Study, which 
contains interviews with the employers of respon-
dents from the General Social Survey, Baldi and 
McBrier (1997) found that relative to whites, black 
workers with comparable education, experience, 
and training, and at similar types of firms, are only 
half as likely to receive promotions. On the basis of 
data from the Multi-City Survey of Urban 
Inequality, Elliott and Smith (2004) found that both 
black men and women are less likely to receive 
promotions at the higher end of the occupational 
hierarchy than white men. These differences exist 
even if the comparisons are made among individu-
als with similar years of education, total work 
experience, prior job-specific experience, and 
employer tenure (and family considerations for 
women).

Racial differences also exist in processes that 
determine promotions in the labor force. Smith 
(2005) found that before receiving promotions, rel-
ative to white men, black men must work longer 
periods of time after leaving school, and black 
women must have more prior job-specific experi-
ence and log more time on the job, all else equal. 
Furthermore, previous research provides evidence 
that blacks’ human capital credentials receive more 
intense scrutiny than whites’ credentials when com-
peting for promotions (Baldi and McBrier 1997), 
particularly when vying for managerial (Wilson, 
Sakura-Lemessy, and West 1999) and supervisory 
positions (Smith 2001).

With respect to job layoffs, Wilson and McBrier 
(2005) found that the percentage of layoffs for 
blacks is nearly twice that for whites (31 percent 
and 16 percent, respectively). Blacks’ greater lay-
off rates exist in both the private and public sectors. 
They also found that blacks are more vulnerable to 
being laid off than whites; increases in tenure with 
employer, college and postcollege education, and 
union membership are associated with decreases in 
the layoff likelihood for whites but not for blacks. 
Thus, blacks face a route toward downward occu-
pational movement that is structured less by tradi-
tional stratification-based causal factors and 
experience downward mobility more rapidly than 
whites (Wilson and Roscigno 2010). Along the 
same line, reentry into the labor market comes with 
additional costs for blacks, as blacks experience 
longer periods of job search than white job seekers 
with similar levels of human capital such as educa-
tion and cognitive skill (Tomaskovic-Devey et al. 
2005).
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Some scholars have suggested that the racial 
wage gap stems from blacks’ deficiencies in human 
capital, skills in particular, or the labor market 
characteristics of blacks rather than discrimination 
(Johnson and Neal 1998; Neal and Johnson 1996; 
O’Neill 1990). However, a long line of research 
that directly tests for discrimination in the labor 
market through field experiments finds evidence of 
a black labor market penalty (Bertrand and 
Mullainathan 2004; Pager 2007; Zhao, Ondrich, 
and Yinger 2006). These studies typically match 
job applicants on every category (e.g., résumé or 
credentials) other than the factor on which discrim-
ination is being tested (e.g., sex, race).

Furthermore, Coleman (2003) found that even 
if employers’ evaluations of workers’ skills on the 
basis of actual on-the-job performance ratings rela-
tive to other workers are controlled, blacks earn 19 
percent less than whites. Less than half (42 per-
cent) of this disadvantage can be attributed to 
blacks’ lower levels of human capital (i.e., educa-
tion, tenure on the job, and age). He also found that 
when white and black men have the same employ-
er’s competitive performance rating and similar 
levels of human capital, racial wage differences 
actually slightly increase. Thus, human capital and 
employers’ job-specific skill ratings explain less 
than half of the black male wage disadvantage.

Research also suggests that certain immigrant 
groups, particularly Mexican immigrants with less 
European features, experience significant levels of 
discrimination, which blocks their ability to fully 
assimilate into American society (Alba 2005; Portes 
and Rumbaut 2014). Using data on four generations 
of Mexican-origin individuals in the United States, 
Telles and Ortiz (2008) also found that among 
fourth-generation Mexican children, 66 percent 
reported being stereotyped by others and 46 percent 
reported experiencing discrimination. Moreover, 
Pager, Western, and Bonikowski (2009) used data 
from a field experiment conducted in the low-wage 
sector of the New York City labor market and found 
that relative to whites with similar resumes, both 
black and Latino applicants were significantly less 
likely to receive callbacks or job offers.

Skin Shade and the Labor Market
Perhaps a useful proxy for race is skin shade, which 
on average differs substantially between blacks and 
nonblacks. However, skin tone also varies within 
racial groups, which enables researchers to investi-
gate whether darker skin shade exercises an inde-
pendent adverse effect on wages. Research on skin 
shade and social outcomes has focused on five 

main issues: employment (Goldsmith, Hamilton, 
and Darity 2006, 2007; Diette et al. 2015), educa-
tional attainment (Keith and Herring 1991; Monk 
2014; Seltzer and Smith 1991), political beliefs 
(Hochschild and Weaver 2007), treatment by the 
criminal justice system, marital outcomes 
(Eberhardt et al. 2006; Gyimah-Brempong and 
Price 2006; Hamilton, Goldsmith, and Darity 
2008), and income (Monk 2014).

With regard to wages, research has established 
that darker skin shade is associated with lower wages 
for black men. Goldsmith et al. (2006, 2007) found 
that although wages for light-skinned black men are 
lower than (but close to) those of whites, wages sub-
stantially decline as skin tone darkens, with medium- 
and dark-skinned blacks earning substantially less 
(by at least 10 percent) than whites. These findings 
hold even if the comparison is made between people 
with similar occupations, levels of education, retro-
spective high school performance level, labor market 
experience, health status, and self-esteem. Their 
studies even accounted for respondents’ socioeco-
nomic background and neighborhood quality at age 
16 as well as current workplace features, such as 
union status, full-time work status, firm size, having 
a supervisory role, and degree of contact with cus-
tomers. Because skin shade is separate from culture 
and unrelated to intelligence among U.S. blacks (Hill 
2002), these differences cannot be attributed to cul-
tural or genetic factors.

Similar to the research on labor market discrim-
ination within the United States, the majority of 
research on skin shade has concentrated on black 
Americans. However, skin tone also varies within 
groups, making it possible to estimate whether 
labor market penalties exist for darker complex-
ioned people from the same immigrant group. 
Given the findings of previous research that labor 
market discrimination exists along racial lines 
within the United States and on the general penalty 
associated with darker skin shade, it is reasonable 
to expect that immigrants with darker skin shade 
experience a penalty in the labor market (Frank, 
Akresh, and Lu 2010; Hersch 2002, 2008, 2011).

For example, researchers have found that darker 
skinned Mexican Americans with more Native 
American characteristics earned significantly less 
and achieved fewer years of schooling than lighter 
skinned Mexican Americans with more European 
characteristics (Murguia and Telles 1996; Telles 
and Murguia 1988). Hersch (2008, 2011) tested 
whether lighter skin shade is statistically associated 
with greater earnings among recent immigrants to 
the United States using data from the NIS. She 
found that even after controlling for education, 
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English-language proficiency, occupation in source 
country, family background, ethnicity, race, and 
country of birth, lighter skinned immigrants earned 
significantly more than their darker skinned coun-
terparts. No previous study, however, has compara-
tively examined variation in earnings by skin shade 
for immigrants by region of origin or by race, 
which leaves open the question of whether the 
association between skin shade and earnings varies 
among immigrants from particular regions of the 
world. Below we address this gap in the literature.

Data and Analytic Plan
Data for this study are from the NIS, a nationally 
representative multi-cohort longitudinal study of 
new legal immigrants to the United States. The data 
were collected from May to November in 2003 and 
contain responses for 8,573 legal immigrants to the 
United States. who received permanent resident sta-
tus. Because disaggregating by particular nation of 
birth yields some subsamples that lack sufficient 
size to provide reliable estimates, we sorted immi-
grants into the following regions of birth: (1) Europe 
and Central Asia; (2) China, East Asia, South Asia, 
and the Pacific; (3) Latin America and the Caribbean; 
(4) Sub-Saharan Africa; and (5) the Middle East and 
North Africa. Analysis was not performed on immi-
grants from Canada, because this region only con-
tained 23 observations.

Nearly half of the NIS sample immigrated from 
Latin America and the Caribbean (45.9 percent); 
this is almost twice as many observations as the 
next largest subsample, China, East Asia, South 
Asia, and the Pacific. In contrast, the Middle 
Eastern and North African region accounts for only 
3.7 percent of the NIS sample, corresponding to 66 
observations.

The first panel of Figure 1 illustrates the distribu-
tion of region of birth across the total NIS sample. 
Because a vast majority of the sample hails from 
Latin America and the Caribbean, Figure 1 also 
shows the racial composition of this subgroup. About 
70 percent of the respondents classify themselves as 
white, and fewer than 10 percent report their race as 
black. Note that the Latin American and Caribbean 
subsample is composed predominantly of immi-
grants from Latin America (roughly 90 percent) 
rather than from the Caribbean (roughly 10 percent).

There are several noteworthy points regarding 
the analytical approach used in this study. First, 
with regard to the measurement of our primary 
variables of interest, wages were measured as the 
natural logarithm of the hourly wage before taxes 
and deductions. For those who reported that they 
were salaried workers, yearly salary was divided 
by the number of weeks worked per year, with that 
figure divided by the number of hours worked per 
week. Second, data on skin shade were based on an 
assessment and report by the interviewer using an 

La�n America & 
the Caribbean 

45.9%

North America, 1.3%

Middle East & 
North Africa, 3.7%

Sub-Saharan 
Africa, 7.4%

China, East Asia, 
South Asia & the 
Pacific, 23.6%

Europe & 
Central Asia, 
18.2%

Region of Birth

No Race 
13.9%

Black 8.2%

White 
70.3%

American Indian / 
Alaska Na�ve 4.6%

> 1 Race 1.6%

Asian / Na�ve 
Hawaiian/ 

Race of La�n American & 
Caribbean Subsample

Figure 1.  Breakdown of New Immigrant Survey sample.
Note: Two hundred eight respondents in the Latin American and Caribbean subsample did not indicate a specific 
country of birth.
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11-point scale ranging from 0 (no pigment/albino) 
to 10 (darkest skin shade possible). The skin shade 
scale is displayed in Figure 2.

Third, in addition to estimating the association 
between skin shade and wages for the full sample, 
we repeated this analysis for four sets of subsam-
ples. The five aforementioned regions of birth rep-
resent the first group of subsamples. The analysis 
was conducted separately for each region. Next, we 
stratified the sample by race and conducted the 
analysis separately for blacks, whites, and Asians. 
These three self-classified racial groups constitute 
89 percent of the total observations in the larger 
sample; other races reported are not large enough 
to yield reliable results. Because the Latin American 
and Caribbean region accounts for a large propor-
tion of the total sample, we then report findings by 
race after excluding this region. Finally, we also 
report findings by race for the Latin American and 
Caribbean subsample alone.

Fourth, we collapsed the racial categories used 
for the Latin American population into black and 
nonblack (insufficient sample size prevented anal-
ysis of Asian respondents in the Latin American 
subsample). Self-reported race is rather problem-
atic among Latin American survey respondents 
(Hattam 2005; Lopez 2005; and Prewitt 2005). 
Prior research has shown that certain exogenous 
factors, such as tenure in the United States and 
socioeconomic status, may affect the race reported 
by Latino immigrants (Tafoya 2005). Furthermore, 
there is often a preference for whiteness (or non-
blackness) among respondents, regardless of phe-
notype (Darity, Dietrich, and Hamilton 2005; 
Golash-Boza and Darity 2008). Latino immigrants 
are more likely than other immigrants to decline to 
respond to questions about race or to select “other” 
options when available (Hitlin, Brown, and Elder 
2007). Therefore, we consider race among Latinos 
as blacks and nonblacks.

Finally, each subsample analysis included three 
separate regression specifications.1 The first model 
is the most parsimonious, controlling for general 
human capital, socioeconomic background, and 

region of residence within the United States. We 
refer to this model as the baseline model. The sec-
ond model adds a control for race/ethnicity when 
the analysis is conducted for each region of origin 
subsample. When the analysis is conducted for 
subsamples stratified by race (both with and with-
out the Latin America and Caribbean subsample), 
we also control for Hispanic versus non-Hispanic 
and region of origin. The final model includes fac-
tors that capture immigrants’ current employment 
characteristics. Although the impact of skin shade 
on earnings may vary by gender within region of 
birth and by race, because of sample size issues, we 
did not conduct these analyses.

Table 1 presents the measures used in this study. 
The measures are grouped according to the models 
in which they are entered into the analysis.

Results
The first set of results is displayed in Table 2, 
which contains the findings of the baseline model 
for the total NIS sample and each subsample (five 
by region, three by race, three by race excluding 
the Latin American and Caribbean region, and two 
by race including only the Latin American region). 
Recall that the baseline model accounts for general 
human capital, socioeconomic background, and 
region of residence within the United States. The 
first model in Table 2 shows that darker skin shade 
is associated with lower wages for the full NIS 
sample (b = –.024). However, the next five models 
show that when the analysis is conducted by region 
of origin, the wage penalty associated with darker 
skin shade is experienced only by immigrants from 
Sub-Saharan Africa (b = –.077). The next three 
models show that the skin shade penalty in wages 
exists among white immigrants (b = –.031), and the 
penalty for white immigrants remains after exclud-
ing Latin America and the Caribbean (b = –.035). 
The final two models suggest a significant wage 
penalty for nonblack immigrants from Latin 
America and the Caribbean (b = –.017).2

Table 3 contains the results for the second 
model specification, which adds race and Hispanic 
versus non-Hispanic to the baseline model when 
the analysis is conducted for the region of origin 
subsamples and Hispanic versus non-Hispanic and 
region of origin when the analysis is conducted for 
subsamples stratified by race. The first model 
shows that the skin shade penalty in wages remains 
significant for the full NIS sample after including 
race and ethnicity in the model. However, the next 
model shows that this result is driven primarily by 
the Latin American and Caribbean subsample; 

Figure 2.  Skin shade scale.
Source: Massey and Martin (2003). Color version 
available as online enhancement.
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Table 1.  Means, standard deviations, and descriptions for variables used in the analysis.

Variable Name Description Metric Mean (SD)

Outcomes  
  Ln(wages) Natural logarithm of hourly wage before 

taxes and deductions
0–4.6 2.400 (.640)

  Actual wages Hourly wage before taxes and deductions 0–99.4 11.030 (1.900)
Predictors for model 1  
  Skin shade Based on interviewer report of skin 

shade
0 = lightest,  
10 = darkest

4.110 (2.240)

Physical characteristics  
  Height below U.S.  

  average
Average height (based on CDC data; 

Ogden et al. 2004) < 69 inches for 
men and < 64 inches for women

0–29.5 4.640 (2.830)

  Height above U.S.  
  average

Average height (based on CDC data; 
Ogden et al. 2004) > 69 inches for 
men and 64 inches for women

0–26.4 .300 (1.450)

  BMI Body mass index: 703 × (weight in 
pounds/height in inches squared)

9.27–100.2 26.600 (6.280)

  Male Respondent is male 0 = no, 1 = yes .590
  Age Year of interview minus year of birth 18–69 36 (9.810)
  Age2/100 (Year of interview minus year of 

birth)2/100
3.2–47.6 13.920 (7.730)

Human capital (profession 
before immigrating  
to U.S.)

 

  Professional Worked in a professional/managerial 
position

0 = no, 1 = yes .200

  Health Worked in a health profession 0 = no, 1 = yes .040
  Service Worked in a service profession 0 = no, 1 = yes .050
  Sales Worked in a sales profession 0 = no, 1 = yes .080
  Production Worked in a production profession 0 = no, 1 = yes .160
  U.S. experience Interview date minus date first worked 

in the United States
0–42 5.310 (6.190)

  (U.S. experience)2/100 (Interview date minus date first worked 
in the United States) 2/100

0–17.6 .660 (1.340)

  Education in United  
  States

Years of education completed within the 
United States

0–18 1.080 (2.590)

  Non-U.S. education Total years of education minus years of 
education in the United States

0–25 12.010 (4.920)

  English proficient Respondent speaks English well or very well 0 = no, 1 = yes .510 (.500)
  New arrival Did not live in United States before 

acquiring green card
0 = adjustee, 1 = 

new arrival
.660

  Spouse from United  
  States

Respondent’s spouse is a U.S. citizen 0 = no, 1 = yes .180

  Memo Interview performed after memo to 
code 0 skin shade only for albinos  
(NIS noticed overuse of zeroes for 
skin shade)

0 = no, 1 = yes .330

Socioeconomic 
background

 

  Father’s education Father’s educational attainment 0–30 6.940 (6.610)
  Income far below Family income at age 16 far below average 0 = no, 1 = yes .030

(continued)
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Variable Name Description Metric Mean (SD)

  Income below Family income at age 16 below average 0 = no, 1 = yes .150
  Income above Family income at age 16 above average 0 = no, 1 = yes .180
  Income far above Family income at age 16 far above average 0 = no, 1 = yes .100
Region of residence in 

United States
 

  Northeast Living in the Northeast 0 = no, 1 = yes .310
  Midwest Living in the Midwest 0 = no, 1 = yes .110
  West Living in the West 0 = no, 1 = yes .350
  South Living in the South 0 = no, 1 = yes .230
Additional controls for 

model 2: race/ethnicity
 

  Hispanic Respondent is Hispanic 0 = no, 1 = yes .410
  AIAN Respondent is American Indian/Alaskan 

Native.
0 = no, 1 = yes .020

  Asian Respondent is Asian 0 = no, 1 = yes .230
  Black/African  

  American
Respondent is black or African American 0 = no, 1 = yes .110

  NHPI Respondent is Native Hawaiian/Pacific 
Islander

0 = no, 1 = yes .010

  White Respondent is white 0 = no, 1 = yes .550
  Multiracial Respondent is multiracial 0 = no, 1 = yes .010
  No race reported Race not reported 0 = no, 1 = yes .070
Additional controls for 

model 3: employment 
characteristics

 

  Employment visa Respondent holds an employment visa 0 = no, 1 = yes .200
  Diversity visa Respondent holds a diversity visa 0 = no, 1 = yes .140
  Tenure Start date of job minus interview date 0–37 years 2.410 (3.790)
  Tenure2/100 (Start date of job minus interview 

date)2/100
0–13.6 .200 (.640)

  Professional Currently works in a professional/
managerial position

0 = no, 1 = yes .190

  Health Currently works in a health profession 0 = no, 1 = yes .090
  Service Currently works in a service profession 0 = no, 1 = yes .230
  Sales Currently works in a sales profession 0 = no, 1 = yes .130
  Production Currently works in a production 

profession
0 = no, 1 = yes .300

  Government job Respondent is employed by a 
governmental entity

0 = no, 1 = yes .040

  Union Respondent’s job is covered by a union 
contract

0 = no, 1 = yes .130

  Outdoor job Profession has high probability of 
outdoor work

0 = no, 1 = yes .170

  Paid hourly Respondent reports wage by the hour 0 = no, 1 = yes .780
  Full-time Respondent works 35 hours or more 

per week
0 = no, 1 = yes .950

  Self-employed Respondent is self-employed 0 = no, 1 = yes .000

Table 1.  (continued)
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there is no evidence of a skin shade penalty in 
wages for any of the other region of birth subsam-
ples examined.

The next three models show that the skin shade 
penalty also remains significant for the white popu-
lation. The inclusion of a control for Hispanic ver-
sus non-Hispanic ethnicity and region of birth 
reduces the magnitude of the penalty by about half 
(b = –.016). In contrast, the skin shade penalty for 
white respondents excluding those from Latin 
America and the Caribbean becomes insignificant. 
Finally, the wage penalty remains for the nonblack 
subsample within the Latin American and 
Caribbean region. The findings in Table 3 remain 
unchanged even after including current employ-
ment characteristics into the analysis, which we 
show in Table 4.

Summary and Discussion
The purpose of this study was to determine whether 
a skin shade penalty exists within the labor market 
among immigrants within the United States. 
Specifically, we examine whether darker skin tone 
is associated with lower wages among immigrants 
using the NIS. The analysis was conducted sepa-
rately for immigrants from five regions. Several 
findings are worthy of note.

First, the results for the analysis on the full 
immigrant sample are similar to those of Hersch 
(2008). We find that the difference in wages 
between two immigrants at the opposite ends of the 
skin shade scale is as large as 24 percent; an immi-
grant with the darkest skin shade on the scale earns 
roughly 76 cents for every dollar earned by an 
immigrant with the lightest skin shade on the NIS 
scale. This is the case after accounting for human 
capital, socioeconomic background, and region of 
residence within the United States. This difference 
declines by only 17 percent after accounting for 
self-reported race and occupational characteristics.

Second, the findings of this study suggest that 
when immigrants are disaggregated by region of 
birth and race, skin shade penalties remain signifi-
cant only for those who were born in Latin America 
and the Caribbean and, intriguingly, for white 
immigrants. We offer an answer for this last finding 
in the discussion that follows.

Thus, wage penalties observed among darker 
immigrants in the NIS are driven by the large per-
centage of immigrants from Latin America and the 
Caribbean. This is consistent with findings produced 
by Frank et al. (2010), who also concluded that dark-
skinned Latinos faced skin shade discrimination 

with respect to earnings. Additionally, the negative 
skin shade coefficient is quite pronounced among 
Latin American and Caribbean immigrants who 
describe themselves as being white.

We find that the skin shade coefficients are not 
significant for black or Asian immigrants when the 
Latin American and Caribbean observations are 
excluded from the analysis and are significant for 
white immigrants only when Hispanic versus non-
Hispanic ethnicity and region of birth are not taken 
into account. Thus, it seems likely that colorism is 
experienced predominantly by Latin American and 
Caribbean immigrants who do not report their race 
as black and that the effects of colorism are much 
less pronounced or potentially nonexistent among 
other racial and national-origin populations. 
Furthermore, we find a significant penalty for non-
black Latin American immigrants with the darkest 
skin shade, who earn roughly 20 percent less than 
their lightest counterparts.

This conclusion is supported by the finding that 
the skin shade penalty in wages observed for the 
white immigrant subsample is explained by 
Hispanic status in the second model specification. 
As noted above, self-reported race is problematic 
among Latin American survey respondents. Self-
reported race may reflect a preference for a white 
identity among respondents, regardless of their phe-
notypic characteristics (Darity et al. 2005). The 
racial and skin shade heterogeneity of the Latin 
American population could cause dissonance 
between the reported race given by respondents 
from that region and how they are perceived racially 
by others, especially potential American employers. 
This conclusion is consistent with our finding that 
the skin shade penalty in wages becomes insignifi-
cant for the white subsample when Hispanic versus 
non-Hispanic status is added to the baseline specifi-
cation; immigrants from this region could identify 
as white racially while having phenotypical features 
often associated with nonwhites.

This is illustrated in Figure 3, which shows the 
distribution of skin shade for white immigrants 
from both outside (top) and inside (bottom) the 
Latin American and Caribbean region. Taken 
together, these panels suggest that there is greater 
discordance between self-reported race and physi-
cal appearance among whites from this region than 
those from the other regions. The mean skin shade 
for white immigrants from regions other than Latin 
America and the Caribbean is 2.38, with a modal 
value of 3. In contrast, white immigrants from 
Latin America and the Caribbean have substan-
tially darker skin, with a mean of 4.09 and a modal 
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value of 5 on the NIS scale. These differences sug-
gest that those reporting their race as white from 
Latin America and the Caribbean are significantly 
darker than those reporting their race as white from 
countries in other regions. Furthermore, 92 percent 
of the immigrants in the total sample who report 
their race as white while having skin shades coded 
at greater than 5 were from Latin America or the 
Caribbean. Given the patterns highlighted in Figure 
3, it is plausible that there is discordance between 
Latin American and Caribbean immigrants’ pat-
terns of racial self-classification and potential 
employers’ perceptions of their races.

The only other group for which a skin shade 
penalty is observed is the Sub-Saharan African 
subsample. However, the estimated skin shade 
effect is explained by race; whites from this region 
earn significantly more ($12.99 per hour) than 
their nonwhite counterparts ($10.08 per hour). 
Therefore, although immigrants from Sub-Saharan 
Africa do not exhibit a penalty for skin shade, they 

do experience a race penalty. It is important to con-
sider, however, the possibility that the band of skin 
tone variation among Sub-Saharan Africans is so 
slight that the inclusion of the race variable elimi-
nates evidence of colorism.

To evaluate this possibility, we analyzed the 
distribution of skin shades in the black Sub-Saharan 
African population (see Figure 4). The mean skin 
shade is 7.66, with a modal value of 8 and a vari-
ance of 3.99. Furthermore, only 7 of 119 black 
Sub-Saharan African respondents were coded as 
having skin shades lighter than 5. It is possible that 
the small number of observations with lighter skin 
shades in the black Sub-Saharan African popula-
tion contributed to the insignificant skin shade 
effect when race is controlled.

Finally, we do not find a connection between 
skin shade and wages for immigrants from (1) 
Europe and Central Asia; (2) China, East Asia, 
South Asia, and the Pacific; and (3) the Middle 
East and North Africa.
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Figure 3.  Skin shade for self-reported white respondents: (a) white respondents excluding Latin 
America and the Caribbean and (b) white respondents from Latin America and the Caribbean.
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Conclusion
In sum, it appears that the finding of a skin shade 
penalty in wages for darker skinned immigrants 
found in studies using data from NIS (e.g., Hersch 
2008) is driven by the large percentage of Latin 
American immigrants included in the original sam-
ple. The skin shade penalty is substantial for Latin 
American immigrants who report their race as non-
black or as white. The effects of colorism, however, 
are much less pronounced or nonexistent among 
other racial and national-origin populations. 
Furthermore, although a skin shade penalty might 
not exist among African immigrants, we do find evi-
dence consistent with wage discrimination by race. 
Below we briefly discuss both the methodological 
implications for studies on discrimination against 
immigrants and the social implications of our results.

Methodological Implications
Our analysis demonstrates that using self-reported 
race in a statistical test for discrimination against 
immigrants can be problematic. It seems that immi-
grant populations from different regions self-report 
race differently from most native-born Americans, 
which can compromise the accuracy of results and 
potentially mask underlying effects within subpop-
ulations. For example, Latinos who report their race 
as white often are dark complexioned, reinforcing 
the difficulty of relying on self-reported race as the 
basis for gauging the degree of discrimination they 
might encounter. Furthermore, the presence of a 
significant skin shade wage penalty in the NIS for 
analyses that do not disaggregate by region of ori-
gin likely will yield findings that suggest a skin 
shade penalty for all immigrants to the United 
States because of the heavy representation of 
respondents from Latin America and the Caribbean.

To take this into account, we suggest that stud-
ies of immigrants based on data that include self-
reported race disaggregate by region to ensure that 
findings for regional subpopulations are consistent 
with findings for an entire sample of immigrants 
before conclusions are drawn. Although our find-
ings have important implications for the study of 
race, they might also apply to other social variables 
that may suffer from inconsistency in data reports 
across different types of respondents. As such, dis-
aggregating by region of origin also could be valu-
able in a variety of analyses.

Our finding that a skin shade penalty is not pres-
ent among African immigrants presents an interest-
ing question for future research. Given that a 
number of studies have observed a skin shade pen-
alty for African Americans, the lack of significant 
results among African immigrants is perplexing and 
warrants further analysis. Indeed, a lack of suffi-
cient skin shade variation in the African subsample 
could have contributed to a lack of significance of 
skin shade for this group in this study. Moreover, 
the relatively small sample size of immigrants from 
Africa might also contribute to the insignificant 
association between skin shade and earnings for this 
group and perhaps for some of the other region of 
birth subgroups. Thus, future studies should explore 
other methods to study the dynamics of skin shade 
discrimination for the African population, particu-
larly as larger samples of African immigrants 
become available as the population grows.

Social Implications
The presence of a skin shade penalty for nonblack 
Latin American and Caribbean immigrants demon-
strates that pervasive inequality of opportunity per-
sists within the United States. This is a real and 
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serious concern given that Latin Americans are the 
largest and fastest growing immigrant population 
in the United States (Ortman and Guaneri 2009). 
Although studies such as this compel readers to 
acknowledge the existence of these disparities, 
future research should focus on the reasons behind 
this unequal treatment to foster policy solutions.

There are a few ways to understand this issue. 
In particular, one must consider the physical and 
ethnic phenotypic characteristics that are more 
likely to be associated with light-skinned Latin 
Americans than with their dark-skinned counter-
parts. In particular, light-skinned Latin Americans 
may appear to have a greater number of European 
characteristics, allowing them to be more readily 
accepted as “Americans” by U.S. employers. 
Therefore, they may face fewer employment disad-
vantages associated with being an immigrant. 
Furthermore, several studies show that skin shade 
discrimination exists in Latin America (Alvarez 
1993; Cruz-Janzen 2001). It is possible, then, that 
Latin American immigrants are more likely to be 
employed by other Latin American immigrants 
who may discriminate on the basis of biases 
imported from their home countries. However, this 
explanation might not explain the observed phe-
nomenon entirely, because skin shade discrimina-
tion is also present in Asian countries but is not 
faced by Asian immigrants in the United States 
(Karan 2008; Perry 2005).

Although not examined in the present study, the 
lack of a statistically significant correlation 
between skin shade and earnings among Asian 
immigrants might stem from the relatively high 
proportion of Asian immigrants who are self-
employed or who work for family-owned busi-
nesses (Portes and Yiu 2013), for whom the 
intensity of skin shade discrimination might be less 
severe. Future work in this area, therefore, should 

examine whether self-employment is correlated 
with darker skin tone, as darker skinned immi-
grants may gravitate toward self-employment or 
entrepreneurship to escape discrimination in the 
wage and salary sector of the economy.

The findings also suggest darker skin tone 
among nonblack immigrants from Latin America 
reduces the likelihood of achieving middle-class 
status, which increases the risk for downward 
assimilation among the children of these immi-
grants. Portes and Rumbaut (2014) suggested that 
children from working-class parents, particularly 
those who reside in weak coethnic communities, 
are at greater risk for experiencing downward 
assimilation—having low educational achievement 
and stagnating into subordinate menial jobs—than 
children of parents with high levels of human capi-
tal who have been able to achieve middle-class sta-
tus in the first generation.

Moreover, although earnings are the only out-
come examined in this study, the results have 
implications for stratification more generally. In 
addition to any direct effect of skin shade on mea-
sures such as health and occupational mobility 
(Williams et al. 1997), the findings suggest that 
skin shade may have an indirect effect on the health 
of nonblack immigrants from Latin America 
through an income effect whereby darker skinned 
immigrants are less able to purchase health- 
promoting goods and services or purchase homes 
in less stressful neighborhoods.

Similarly, the findings suggest that darker skin 
shade may negatively affect the types of employ-
ment prospects for immigrants. Portes and Rumbaut 
(2014) noted,

Employers as a whole may be indifferent toward a 
particular group, or they may have a positive or 
negative view of it. Positive or negative 
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typification of a specific minority can take, in turn, 
different forms. For example, widespread 
discrimination may hold that certain groups are 
able only to preform low-wage menial labor 
(“Mexican work” or in an earlier time, “coolie 
labor”), or it can hold that they are simply too 
incompetent to be employable at all. In the first 
instance discrimination contributes to confinement 
of the group to the low-wage segment of the labor 
market; in the second it contributes to it exclusion 
and hence unemployment. (p. 141)

If employers positively correlate skin shade with 
negative typification, then darker skinned immi-
grants from Latin America and the Caribbean may 
have less favorable employment prospects. 
Although the models in Table 4 directly control for 
profession, we cannot rule out the possibility that 
darker skinned immigrants have varying opportuni-
ties for upward mobility within a given profession, 
which could have a negative impact on earnings.

Although we did not find convincing evidence 
that colorism affects all new immigrants to the 
United States, it is important to point out that this 
does not mean that skin shade is inconsequential. On 
the contrary, the findings from this (and other afore-
mentioned studies) suggest that skin shade remains 
an extremely important determinant of life outcomes 
for a large proportion of both immigrants and non-
immigrants. For example, the lightest immigrants in 
this sample have an average hourly wage that is sub-
stantially greater than the average wage of the dark-
est immigrants in the sample. Figure 5 demonstrates 
a steady decrease in hourly wage as skin shade 
becomes darker among immigrants in the NIS.

What is clear is that discrimination toward 
immigrants is prevalent in the U.S. labor market. 
Despite the notion that the United States generally 
considers itself to be the land of equal opportunity 
for all, it is evident that serious impediments to suc-
cess exist for a large and growing portion of the 
immigrant population.

Notes
	 Alexis Rosenblum’s contribution to this article was 

made while an undergraduate at Duke University in 
2010.

  1.	 These specifications are consistent with Hersch (2008).
  2.	 The specification using only data for nonblack immi-

grants from Latin America and the Caribbean essen-
tially drops most immigrants from the Caribbean, 
particularly individuals from the English-speaking 
Caribbean, because most immigrants from this 
region self-report as black.
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